From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Cc:

Mesires, George R. George.Mesires@FaegreBD.com
Eudora check

January 30, 2019 at 1:46 PM

Eric D. Schwerin eschwerin@rosemontseneca.com

R. Hunter Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

Eric:

Without waiving any rights to the aggregate amount of the Eudora check, Hunter requests that
75% of the $21K Eudora check be paid to his account.

Did you forward me a copy of the operating agreement for RSP Holdings? | only have the
Skaneateles LLC operating agreement handy. Can you explain the basis for your continued
operation of the broker-dealer and the source documents/provisions that evidence that
authority?

Thanks,
George
George R. Mesires
Partner

george.mesires@FaegreBD.com Download vCard
D: +1 312 356 5101 | M: +1 312 972 4151

Faegre Baker Daniels LLP
311 S. Wacker Drive | Suite 4300 | Chicago, IL 60606, USA
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From: Eric Schwerin eschwerin@rosemontseneca.com
Subject: Re: Eudora check
Date: January 30, 2019 at 2:39 PM
To: George R. Mesires George.Mesires@FaegreBD.com
Cc: R. Hunter Biden rhbdc@icloud.com

George,

| can get Joan to send you the RSP Holdings Operating agreement shortly in case you don't
have it.

But as way of background, a FINRA registered broker-dealer can only be operated by
someone who holds a Series 24 FINRA license. | am the only one affiliated with this broker-
dealer that has that license. Because of that the operating agreement designates me as the
managing member. Changing that designation would require approval by FINRA.

Happy to explain further if need be.

Thanks,

Eric

On Jan 30, 2019, at 4:46 PM, Mesires, George R. <George.Mesires@FaegreBD.com> wrote:

Eric:

Without waiving any rights to the aggregate amount of the Eudora check, Hunter requests
that 75% of the $21K Eudora check be paid to his account.

Did you forward me a copy of the operating agreement for RSP Holdings? | only have the
Skaneateles LLC operating agreement handy. Can you explain the basis for your continued
operation of the broker-dealer and the source documents/provisions that evidence that
authority?

Thanks,
George
George R. Mesires
Partner

george.mesires@FaeqgreBD.com Download vCard
D: +1 312356 5101 | M: +1 312 972 4151

Faegre Baker Daniels LLP
311 S. Wacker Drive | Suite 4300 | Chicago, IL 60606, USA

Eric D. Schwerin
2550 M Street NW
Washington, DC 20037
(202) 333-5196
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