From

: Jeff Cooper jcooper@eudoraglobal.com
Subject: Re: Expenses/Distribution
Date: January 19, 2019 at 9:06 AM >

To

: Robert Hunter rhbdc@icloud.com

FYI - we are closing in on another partial sale (approx 30% at an 850m valuation) in the next 3
weeks. If it goes through, your issue below isn’t going to go away. Let me know what you want
me to do with that money if it comes in.

Will be significant.

The total payout of 300m. We have approx 75 in debt so will distribute 225.

Eudora currently owns approx 18% of Citizens so we would get our proportional amount of the
225. Not a bad day, if it happens. . .

Sent from my iPhone

OndJan 19, 2019, at 12:51 AM, Robert Hunter <rhbdc@icloud.com> wrote:

If you touch one dime of that money | promise | will file a law suit against you on Tuesday. |
promise Eric- no more of your bullshit.

Sent from my iPad

On Jan 18, 2019, at 5:01 PM, Eric Schwerin <eschwerin@rosemontseneca.com> wrote:

Hunter,

We just got a check for $21,590 from Eudora which represents our Q4 Distribution from
them.

In addition, you owe some money to RSA for expenses - mostly our quarterly insurance
payment. That totals $1,563.55.

After deducting that amount, | will transfer the remainder of your 75%, which would be
$14,628.95 to Owasco, LLC. This is all based on the understanding that you still intend to
transfer your share of the broker-dealer to me in exchange for my share of BHR. If that is
not the case, there is a capital contribution due to RSPI of approximately $15,000 and an
additional share of your Eudora distribution (approximately $11,250) would have to go to
that.

If | don't hear from you (or George or Katie on your behalf) by Monday Joan will deposit the
Eudora check, take out your share of RSA expenses and transfer the remaining $14,628.95
to Owasco, LLC.

Thanks,

Eric

Eric D. Schwerin
2550 M Street NW
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Date:
To:
Cc:

: Eric Schwerin eschwerin@rosemontseneca.com
: Expenses/Distribution

January 18, 2019 at 2:01 PM
Robert Hunter rhbdc@icloud.com
George R. Mesires george.mesires@FaegreBD.com, Katie Dodge dodgekatie13@gmail.com

Hunter,
We just got a check for $21,590 from Eudora which represents our Q4 Distribution from them.

In addition, you owe some money to RSA for expenses - mostly our quarterly insurance
payment. That totals $1,563.55.

After deducting that amount, | will transfer the remainder of your 75%, which would be
$14,628.95 to Owasco, LLC. This is all based on the understanding that you still intend to
transfer your share of the broker-dealer to me in exchange for my share of BHR. If that is not
the case, there is a capital contribution due to RSPI of approximately $15,000 and an
additional share of your Eudora distribution (approximately $11,250) would have to go to that.

If | don’t hear from you (or George or Katie on your behalf) by Monday Joan will deposit the
Eudora check, take out your share of RSA expenses and transfer the remaining $14,628.95 to
Owasco, LLC.

Thanks,

Eric

Eric D. Schwerin
2550 M Street NW
Washington, DC 20037
(202) 333-5196

eschwerin@rosemontseneca.com
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